
Grafton High School
Grafton MA

Furniture Bid Tally Stefura Associates
Opening: 7 February 2012

 Red Thread  Hertz  COR  Lakeshore  WB Mason  RH LORD  Allied Solutions  Wenger  HCONE International 
 Technology 

Internationl Inc. 

 A1: Miscellaneous Furniture 108,476.00$                                 no bid 99,896.00$                                   no bid 154,874.00$                  

B1: Medical Furniture no bid 6,515.76$                                     7,952.00$                                     no bid 6,231.00$                      

B2: Area Rugs no bid 2,004.95$                                     2,395.00$                                     1,835.40$                                      2,015.00$                      

C1: Metal Shelving no bid 70,717.84$                                   53,841.00$                                   no bid 69,307.00$                    

C2: Waste Receptacles no bid 7,707.63$                                     no bid no bid 8,015.00$                      

E1: Academic Skills Equipment no bid 10,067.47$                                   no bid 1,807.97$                                      no bid

E2: Admin and Office Equipment no bid 25,259.89$                                   no bid 118.68$                                         no bid

E3: Art Equipment no bid 14,373.15$                                   no bid no bid 10,459.00$                    

E4: Counseling Equipment no bid 1,197.39$                                     no bid 210.22$                                         599.00$                         

E5: Custodial Equipment no bid 130,866.86$                                 no bid no bid no bid

E6: General Classroom Equipment no bid 65,877.37$                                   no bid 15,946.50$                                    9,145.00$                      

E7: Gym, Alt PE, Lockerroom Equipment no bid 96,050.65$                                   no bid 2,732.33$                                      46,501.99$                    

E8: Kitchen Smallwares no bid 99,664.13$                                   no bid no bid no bid

E9: Media Center Equipment no bid 16,838.51$                                   no bid 91.54$                                           7,002.00$                      

E10: Music Equipment no bid 163,814.29$                                 no bid no bid no bid

E11: Medical Equipment no bid 24,810.46$                                   no bid no bid 19,191.00$                    

E12: OT/PTEquipment no bid 7,611.15$                                     no bid 183.08$                                         4,636.00$                      

E13: Science and STE Equipment no bid 108,728.48$                                 no bid no bid no bid

E14: SPED Equipment no bid 19,710.18$                                   no bid 3,770.03$                                      1,656.00$                      

E15: Tech Equipment no bid 61,531.89$                                   no bid no bid no bid

E16: Tech Lit Equipment no bid 468.94$                                        no bid no bid no bid
TOTAL 108,476.00$                                 933,816.99$                                 164,084.00$                                 26,695.75$                                    339,631.99$                  

CHECKLIST

Requested from Walpole

 yes
GDELPESCHIO@RED-
THREAD.COM 

 yes
KAREN@HERTZFURNITURE.CO
M 

 yes
JOY.NELSON@CREATIVEOFFIC
ERESOURES.COM 

 yes
ATINO@LAKESHORELEARNING
.COM 

 yes
BRIAN.VILLENEUVE@
WBMASON.COM 

 yes 
ROBROMAY@RHLCO.COM 

 yes
CONTRACTS@ALLIEDSOLUTIO
NENTERPRISE.COM 

 yes
NEIL.HOWELL@WENG
ERCORP.COM 

 yes
edkabutey@hconecomp
anies.com 

 yes
quotes@tii-usa.com  

Bid Bond Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Affidavits Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Acknowledgement of Addenda Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

References Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

 NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 



Walpole Middle School
Walpole MA

Furniture, Fixtures and Equipment 
Public Bid Tally

Stefura Associates
Opening: 21 December 2023

 Red Thread  Hertz  COR  Lakeshore  WB Mason  Low Bid 
 SAI 

Budget Value  Comments  Difference 

 partial bid  partial bid  as specified 
 A1: Miscellaneous Furniture 108,476.00$                                 no bid 99,896.00$                                   no bid 154,874.00$                  154,874.00$       119,350.00$       129.76%

as specified as specified as specified
B1: Medical Furniture no bid 6,515.76$                                     7,952.00$                                     no bid 6,231.00$                      6,231.00$           5,075.00$           122.78%

as specified as specified alternate as specified
B2: Area Rugs no bid 2,004.95$                                     2,395.00$                                     1,835.40$                                      2,015.00$                      2,004.95$           2,250.00$           89.11%

as specified alternate as specified
C1: Metal Shelving no bid 70,717.84$                                   53,841.00$                                   no bid 69,307.00$                    53,841.00$         36,400.00$         147.91%

as specified as specified
C2: Waste Receptacles no bid 7,707.63$                                     no bid no bid 8,015.00$                      7,707.63$           7,500.00$           102.77%

partial bid partial bid
E1: Academic Skills Equipment no bid 10,067.47$                                   no bid 1,807.97$                                      no bid 10,067.47$         11,300.00$         Item by item 89.09%

as spec'd/alternate partial bid
E2: Admin and Office Equipment no bid 25,259.89$                                   no bid 118.68$                                         no bid 25,259.89$         23,300.00$         Item by item 108.41%

as specified partial bid
E3: Art Equipment no bid 14,373.15$                                   no bid no bid 10,459.00$                    14,373.15$         11,017.50$         Item by item 130.46%

as specified partial bid partial bid
E4: Counseling Equipment no bid 1,197.39$                                     no bid 210.22$                                         599.00$                         1,197.39$           1,700.00$           Item by item 70.43%

as spec'd/alternate
E5: Custodial Equipment no bid 130,866.86$                                 no bid no bid no bid 130,866.86$       120,000.00$       Item by item 109.06%

as spec'd/alternate partial bid partial bid
E6: General Classroom Equipment no bid 65,877.37$                                   no bid 15,946.50$                                    9,145.00$                      65,877.37$         48,840.00$         Item by item 134.88%

as spec'd/alternate partial bid partial bid
E7: Gym, Alt PE, Lockerroom Equipment no bid 96,050.65$                                   no bid 2,732.33$                                      46,501.99$                    96,050.65$         91,230.00$         Item by item 105.28%

as spec'd/alternate
E8: Kitchen Smallwares no bid 99,664.13$                                   no bid no bid no bid 99,664.13$         34,235.00$         Item by item 291.12%

as specified partial bid partial bid
E9: Media Center Equipment no bid 16,838.51$                                   no bid 91.54$                                           7,002.00$                      16,838.51$         13,900.00$         Item by item 121.14%

as spec'd/alternate
E10: Music Equipment no bid 163,814.29$                                 no bid no bid no bid 163,814.29$       45,700.00$         Item by item 358.46%

as specified partial bid
E11: Medical Equipment no bid 24,810.46$                                   no bid no bid 19,191.00$                    24,810.46$         21,900.00$         Item by item 113.29%

as specified partial bid partial bid
E12: OT/PTEquipment no bid 7,611.15$                                     no bid 183.08$                                         4,636.00$                      7,611.15$           5,500.00$           Item by item 138.38%

partial bid
E13: Science and STE Equipment no bid 108,728.48$                                 no bid no bid no bid 108,728.48$       107,100.00$       Item by item 101.52%

as spec'd/alternate partial bid partial bid
E14: SPED Equipment no bid 19,710.18$                                   no bid 3,770.03$                                      1,656.00$                      19,710.18$         19,800.00$         Item by item 99.55%

partial bid
E15: Tech Equipment no bid 61,531.89$                                   no bid no bid no bid 61,531.89$         24,900.00$         Item by item 247.12%

as specified

E16: Tech Lit Equipment no bid 468.94$                                        no bid no bid no bid 468.94$              350.00$              Item by item 133.98%

TOTAL 108,476.00$                                 933,816.99$                                 164,084.00$                                 26,695.75$                                    339,631.99$                  1,071,529.39$    751,347.50$       142.61%

Low bid
Low bid with acceptable alternate
Partial bid
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